: \
“CITY OF

TORRINGTON

Council Chambers
436 East 22" Ave.
Torrington, WY

City Council Agenda
Tuesday Nov. 1%, 2016
7:00 P.M.

* Call the meeting to order.
* Pledge of Allegiance.

* Mayor’s Correspondence:
The Council Meeting on Tuesday, November 15% has been changed to Monday, November 14, 2016 due to a conflict
with the MEAN Board meetings in North Platte, NE.

* Approval of the Consent Agenda which includes:
The minutes from the 10-18-16 Council Meeting as published.

* Approval of the Agenda.

* Public Forum.
For Non Agenda items, there is a time limit of 2 minutes and the speaker must sign up before the meeting. This is a time
for the Council to listen, NO ACTION WILL BE TAKEN.

Action Items:

1) Proclamation:

Declaring November 14-20™, 2016 as Wyoming Apprenticeship Week.
Staff Reference: Dana Youtz, Electrical Supervisor

2) Council Consideration:
Table Mountain Vineyards, LLC has requested a catering permit for a WY Arts Council Social Hour and Gathering at 215t &
Main on November 10t, 2016 from 4:00 p.m. to 8:00 p.m.

3) Ordinance 1 Reading.
Relating to Vicious Animals.
Staff Reference: Jim Eddington, City Attorney

4) Council Consideration: _ _

Request from West Highway Water and Sewer District to amend the City ordinance to bill West Highway Water and Sewer
District for sewer based on monthly flow.

Reference: Jerry Canaday, Chalrman of West Highway Water and Sewer

Staff Reference: Jim Eddington, City Attorney




5) Ordinance 1 Reading.
Relating to the adoption of the 2015 International Building Codes.
Staff Reference: Dennis Estes, Building Official

6) Council Consideration:
Proposals for the 2017 Golf Season.

Staff Reference: David Dent, Golf Pro

a) 2017 Golf Rates.

b) 2017 Golf Tournament Schedule.

¢) 2017 Senior and Senior Couple Rates.

d) Lease of Five City Golf Carts to individuals for the 2017 Golf Season.

7) Approval of the bills from 10-19-16 to 11-01-16.

Staff Reference: Lynette Strecker, Clerk/Treasurer

8) Adjourn.




City of Torrington )

County of Gosnen )

State of Wyoming )

The Torrington City Council met in regular session on Tuesday, October 18", 2016 in the City

Council Chambers at 436 East 22" Ave. at 7:00 p.m. Present: Mayor Varney, Council Members Adams,

Hill, Kelly and Law. Also Present: Clerk/Treasurer Strecker, Attorney Eddington, Assistant Police Chief

Michael Matthews, Project Manager Weis, and Deputy City Clerk Kinnan.

Mayor Varney called the meeting to order.

Councilman Bill Law led the Pledge of Allegiance.

Mayor Varney read a letter from Cydney Sharp and her Eastern Wyoming College (EWC) Basics
in U.S. & Wyoming Government class. They thanked the Mayor and Council for allowing them to visit and
observe the October 4™ Council meeting. They enjoyed watching their local government in action.

‘ Councilman Adams moved and Councilwoman Hill seconded to approve the consent agenda
which included the minutes of the 10-04-16 Council meeting as published and all actions therein be
ratified, and to change the Tuesday, November 15% 2016 Council meeting to Monday, November 14t
2016 due to a conflict with the MEAN board meeting. Motion carried unanimously.

Councilman Kelly moved and Councilman Law seconded to approve the agenda as presented.
Motion carried unanimously.

Robert Reeves manager of 77 Capital Corporation’s Spririts Bar addressed the Council. He stated
that the sales tax for the bar had been paid today by ACH and presented a letter from First State Bank
stating they guaranteed payment. Mr. Reeves requested the Council remove 77 Capital Corporation’s
liquor license suspension from the agenda. Attorney Eddington stated the City was notified by 77 Capital
Corporation this afternoon the sales tax had been paid, the City then notified the liquor division about
the payment, but the liquor division stated as of 4:45 p.m. they still had not received notification of the
payment. Attorney Eddington stated the Council could take no action, the normal action of suspending
the license until the City receives notification of payment from the State of WY, or defer the suspension
until 9:00 a.m. or noon tomorrow to allow time for the payment to go through. Mayor Varney thanked
Mr. Reeves and stated when the Council got to this item on the agenda they would decide what action
needed taken.

Attorney Eddington read a proclamation declaring November 2016 as National American Indian
Heritage Month. Councilman Law moved and Councilwoman Hill seconded to approve the proclamation
as presented. Motion carried unanimously.

Ashley Harpstreith, Executive Director of Goshen County Economic Development addressed the
Council. She presented a check to the City in the amount of $6,208.36 for an Economic Development
Infrastructure Investment Fund Grant. The money will be used at the City’s Pioneer RV Park to upgrade
the electrical from 30 amps to 50 amps. She commented the RV Park will be especially busy next year
with visitors coming through the area to view the solar eclipse. She stated her office has been educating
the voters on the importance of renewing the fifth penny and lodging tax. The Council thanked Goshen
County Economic Development for the grant.

Councilman Adams moved and Councilman Law seconded to defer the suspension of 77 Capital
Corporation’s liquor license due to sales tax delinquency until noon on October 19, 2016. Motion
carried unanimously.

Mayor Varney recommended appointing Building Official Dennis Estes as the City
Representative on the Intergovernmental Sewer Committee to replace retired City Engineer Robert
Juve, the term is indefinite. Councilman Adams moved and Councilwoman Hill seconded to approve the
appointment as presented. Motion carried unanimously.

Project Manager Weis presented the bid results for the Sanitary Sewer Improvements. Staff
recommended awarding the Base Bid, to Bivens Construction of Torrington, WY for a total amount of
$153,430 and reserve $15,343 (10%) for contingency, for a completed project total of $168,773 and
reserve the balance of the CDBG funds in the amount of $28,692 for design fees and future CDBG
projects. Project Manager Weis stated this is a sewer lining project from 11t Ave. to 14 Ave. on Haines,
West B and West C Streets. Councilman Adams inquired if the manholes would be replaced. Project
Manager Weis stated no, replacing them would put the project over budget. Councilman Kelly inquired
about Bivens’ experience. Project Manager Weis stated they have done work in the Cold Springs
Industrial Park, were currently working on the new project at Eastern Wyoming College, and if awarded
this City project would start on it in late winter or early next spring. Councilwoman Hill moved and
Councilman Law seconded to approve awarding the project to Bivens Construction as presented. Motion
carried unanimously.

The bills from 10-05-16 to 10-18-16 were presented for payment. Councilman Adams moved
and Councilman Kelly seconded to approve the bills for payment as presented. Motion carried
unanimously. _ .

Councilman Kelly moved and Councilwoman Hill seconded to adjourn to executive session to
discuss litigation and personnel. Motion carried unanimously.

Page | 1



Councilwoman Hill moved and Counciiman Adams seconded to return the Council to regular

session. Motion carried unanimously.

Councilwoman Hill asked Attorney Eddington if the Council needed to take any action. Attorney
Eddington stated no they did not.
Teri Shinost addressed the Council. She invited the Council to attend an open house at the
Waggin Tails Animal Shelter from 2:00 p.m. to 6:00 p.m. on Friday October 28™, 2016.
Councilwoman Hill moved and Councilman Adams seconded that there being no further
business to come before the Council to adjourn at 8:10 p.m. Motion carried unanimously.
The following bills were approved for payment: 58300 BANKER'S BANK OFTHE WEST INC QTRly
lease purchase 0118-001 65565.26;58301 MUNICIPAL ENERGY AGENCY OF NE wholesale power
489152 .64;58302 WYRULEC CO LANDFILL ELECTRIC(2meters)194.79;58303 WOOD,CHEYENNE final
bill/cr rtrn 66.71;58304 UDELHOVEN,JONI G final bill/dep rtrn 37.70;58305 TOULOUSE,BRIAN final
bill/dep rtrn 21.90;58306 TREASURER STATE OF CONNECTICUT 2016 unclaimed property 55.10;58307
SMITH,TIMOTHY&NORINE final bill/dep rtrn 30.93;58308 BINGHAM,BRANDI refund tablecloths/dep rtrn
64.00;58309 MILLER,DAVID E final bill/dep rtrn 96.30;5831.0 ACCENT WIRE-TIE 12ga galv hi-tensile tying
wire-110.86cwt 5432.14;58311 ACUITY SPECIALTY PRODUCTS INC glass cleaner,hand cleaner
302.40;58312 BENCHMARK OF TORRINGTON 2016 flooding elev@golf course/culverts 977.00;58313 CH
GUERNSEY&CO pass-on 2015TY 1650.00;58314 CANON FINANCIAL SERVICES INC copier contracts
524.25;58315 CASELLE INC Contract Support&Maint 1990.00;58316 CASPER COLLEGE continuing
education-new emply 424.00;58317 CITY OF TORRINGTON small claims filing fee/court
chrgs, pitchers, titles, lien 106.24;58318 CITY OF TORRINGTON payroll withhold-utilities/golf/phone data
240.53;58319 CITY OF TORRINGTON c/o FIRST STATE BANK optional sales tax 71129.64;58320
ABSOLUTE SOLUTIONS rmv&instll dual hd remove mnt radio-ambulance 761.49;58321 COMMUNITY
HOSPITAL amblnce spplies 213.77;58322 CROELL REDI-MIX INC 6' retaining wall block-unloadng ramp-
baler 1170.00;58323 CUMMINS CENTRAL POWER LLC Planned Maint.-fire dept generac 545.56;58324 D
AR E Alcohol&tobacco Compliance check 600.00;58325 DANA KEPNER CO INC 8” register meter,2" tee
less access,transistn gland packs 2666.51;58326 DECKER,STEVE icemelt, fertilizer,anti-freezex1 case
10017.00;58327 DENT,DAVID A golf pro payable 1289.00;58328 DIVERSIFIED SERVICES cleaning visits
360.00;58329 DIVERSIFIED SERVICES PER AGREEMENT 1500.00; 58330 DPC INDUSTRIES INC Sodium
Hypo 12.5%,bulk 2250.00;58331 JAMES A. EDDINGTON PC extended hours for attorney 1135.47;58332
JAMES A. EDDINGTON PC CITY ATTORNEY 6000.00;58333 EMERGENCY APPARATUS MAINT INC pmp
tests,rpr primer inoperative,deck gun,intake relief srvc transmission,dschrg valve kit,inspected foam pro
system 3434.22;58334 ENERGY LABORATORIES INC lab testing/pwsid/ process control 144.00;58335
FALES ENTERPRISES startup heaters,winterizd&clean ice mach,chngd water filter 498.00;58336 FAMILY
SUPPORT REGISTRY PAYROLL WITHHOLD 235.97;58337 FARWEST LINE SPECIALTIES LLC 24" fiberglass
bolt cutter 296.52;58338 FLOYD'S TRUCK CENTER INC. spigot cap,hardwr kit spare 62.62;58339
POWERPLAN screws,grommets,inserts 64.12;58340 FRENCHMAN VALLEY FARMERS COOP INC. 55 gal
def terracair{blue def) 230.25;58341 PRO QUALITY PEST CONTROL pest control 90.00;58342 GE BETZ INC
chemical management-prison 2188.73;58343 BARCO PRODUCTS CO rplcmnt 35gal plain grbg can hood
lid 160.24;58344 GLOBAL EQUIPMENT CO 18.5Lx18.5Wx14.75H dome lid 64.86;58345 GOSHEN CO
ECONOMIC 1/4 Cent sales tax 17782.41;58346 GOSHEN CO ECONOMIC monthly contribution
1980.00;58347 GOSHEN CO ECONOMIC annual meeting dues 300.00;58348 GREAT-WEST TRUST CO LLC
payroll withhold 1575.62;58349 GREATAMERICA FINANCIAL SERVICES CORP COPIER LEASES
483.00;58350 PEACHTREE BUSINESS PRODUCTS hardness test kit refill-50 tests 93.97; 58351
HICKEY&EVANS LLP pass on 2016, tariff revisions 7812.85;58352 HYATT,CHARLES H striping,
arrows,handicap mrkngs priect 7286.65;58353 KNUDSEN LAW OFFICES Municipal Court Judge 1600.00;
58354 KOIS BROTHERS EQUIPMENT CO lids for carts-trash 1115.18;58355 LUJAN CLEANING SERVICE LLC
cleaning&window cleaning 230.00;58356 NEOFUNDS by NEOPOST postage-neopost acct 125.43;58357
MCKEE,KAREN R&MARTIN B utv seat covered 90.00;58358 MCMASTER-CARR SUPPLY CO tube fittings,on
Joff valve,nipple,fittings 150.91;58359 MERITAIN HEALTH INC premium&life premium 27015.59;58360
MERIDIAN TRUST FEDERAL CREDIT UNION PAYROLL WITHHOLD 3165.00;58361 MOTOROLA SOLUTIONS
INC. Srvc Agreemnt-disptch serv,ntwrk monitors 4650.21;58362 MUNICIPAL CODE CORPORATION
Annual web hosting 900.00;58363 MUNICIPAL ENERGY AGENCY OF NE monthly rita installment
4276.57;58364 NEWMAN TRAFFIC SIGNS in-street ped crossing 315.74;58365 NORTH PARK TRANS CO
wooden boxes containing artwork 70.50;58366 OLSON TIRE recaps,repair,patch tires 1142.46;58367
ONE CALL OF WY tickets for CDC code TRG 96.75;58368 PANHANDLE COOP coffee filters,purchasing
lunch,sugar,15/40,grease lube,indo!/iso hyd 0il,50/50 antifreeze,tire,tubes,15/40 supertms,dyed
ruby,dyed #1,unleaded gas 13783.45;58369 ENVIRO SERVICES INC lab analysis ecoli outfall,pond3,
influent, prison 180.00;58370 PINNACLE BANK usps,travel exp,plumbing inspector certify,car show
exp,trigger gun,bytebox filters,batteries,pipe bursting/financing/public wrks books,paypal emp
recivables,dishsoap,techstreet print edition NS elec mtrs,wing joints,pvc, pipe,hose,nipple,dbc irrigation
cts stiffner,helmet progrm-big hammer shields 2554.01;58371 PORT-A-POTS BY TDS INC rental soccer
fields/sports complex 307.03;58372 PRINT EXPRESS INC UPS 71.11;58373 RAILROAD MANAGEMENT CO
HLLLC license fees 2017-2018 146.41;58374 RINGLE,DANIEL K. museum contract consultant 750.00;

Page | 2



58375 SAM'S CLUB/SYCHRONY BANK honeywell 8.5W LED bulb set-10pack 44.96;58376 DBC
IRRIGATION SUPPLY solenoids 222.39:58377 TIMBERLINE ELECTRIC & CONTROL CORP annual global care

software rnwl 4375.00;58378 TORRINGTON FIRE DEPT fall fire school reimbursement 120.00;58379
TORRINGTON OFFICE SUPPLY copy paper,receipt books,ink cartridges,binders,report covers,folders,
roller cleaner,labels,pens,ribbons, batteries,logitech R400 presenter 656.17;58380 TOUCHTONE
COMMUNICATIONS INC. long distance 74.91;58381 U S POSTMASTER Credit for postage 850.00;58382
VALLEY MERCANTILE CO batteries 143.95;58383 VERIZON WIRELESS cell phone/fire dept 56.11;58384
WALTON,JAMES H AIRPORT ASSIST CONTRACT 1500.00;58385 WAMCO LAB INC full effulent toxicity
test, NPDES'STUDY, Full Chronic Toxicity test 2280.00;58386 WASHINGTON NATIONAL INSURANCE CO
PAYROLL WITHHOLD 32.70;58387 WEGLIN JR.,ED Mow/Trim - lift station/1402 W A 214.00;58388
WELLS FARGO BANK N.A. 2007&2011 bond principal/interest 425199.79;58389 WELLS FARGO BANK
N.A. Trustee Fee 10/16/16-10/15/2017 3500.00;58390 WESTERN COOPERATIVE CO dyed prem,/diesel
2573.75;58391 WESTERN PATHOLOGY CONSULTANTS drug screen,urine collection 62.10;58392
WORKING PERSON'S STORE carolina boots 123.24;58393 WRIGHT,JERRY W. AIRPORT CONTRACT
1575.00;58394 WY CHILD SUPPORT PAYROLL WITHHOLD 262.61;58395 WY CHILD SUPPORT PAYROLL
WITHHOLD 230.76;58396 WY DEPT OF HEALTH Business License-ambulance 20.00;58397 WY DEPT OF
TRANSPORTATION transfer amb#MS51 license plate- 1211 5.00;58398 RESPOND FIRST AID SYSTEMS OF
WY 1st aid kit supplies 216.72;58399 WY HEALTH FAIRS chemistry panel/wellness screening 65.00;58400
TORRINGTON TELEGRAM legals,advertising 2115.76;58401 WY STATE TREASURER'S OFFICE 2016
unclaimed property 35.09;58402 YOUNGER,TOD M ground maint 100.00;58403 SCOTT,STEVEN E final
bill-dep rtrn 81.67;58404 HURLEY,TANYA cr rtrn rplc ck#54133 44.34;58405 BALSER,GENTRY dep rtrn-
rplc ck #54839 14.30;58406 GOULART,HOLLY cr rtrn-rplc ck #55083 52.91;58407 MCINTOSH,FAY
&GWEN dep rtrn-rplc ck #55086 80.32;58408 QUINONEZ,SUZANNE replace pr check #44501
172.23;58409 GLEN H ERDMAN ESTATE final bill/dep rtrn 173.40

Page | 3



CITY OF

TORRINGTON

Proclamation

WHEREAS, we are at a time when the nation needs skilled workers, apprenticeship helps
Wyoming compete more effectively in the global economy, and contributes to Wyoming's
economic development, sustained growth, and state security; and,

WHEREAS, this earn-while- you- learn model ensures higher earnings for apprentices and a
highly skilled workforce. Apprenticeship USA ensures quality training by combining on-the-job
training with theoretical instruction; and,

WHEREAS, today in Torrington, there are two employers offering Registered Apprenticeship
training to active apprentices; and,

WHEREAS, over the years, thousands of individuals have completed their registered
apprenticeship throughout Wyoming in both union and non-union programs; and,

WHEREAS, the demand for skilled workers will continue to increase, Registered Apprenticeship
is a'time tested and proven method of ensuring that the demand can be met, not only in
Wyoming, but nationwide as well. Apprenticeship USA will endeavor to keep Wyoming on the
cutting edge of economic growth throughout the 21% century; and,

WHEREAS, November 14-20, 2016 has been proclaimed “NATIONAL APPRENTICESHIP WEEK” by
the President of the United States of America;

Now, Therefore, I, Michael E. Varney, Mayor of the City of Torrington do hereby declare
November 14-20, 2016 as

“Wyoming Apprenticeship Week”

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, | have hereunto set my hand and caused the official seal of the City of
Torrington to be affixed this day of November, 2016.

Michael E. Varney, Mayor



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING AND RE-ENACTING SECTION
6.04.420 OF THE TORRINGTON MUNICIPAL CODE, 2016
REVISIONS, RELATING TO VICIOUS ANIMALS.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF TORRINGTON,

WYOMING:

Section 1: That Section 6.04.420 of the Revised Ordinances of the City of Torrington,
Wyoming, 2016 Revisions, be and it is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 6.04.420 Vicious animals

A. Vicious animals prohibited: Any animal that constitutes a physical threat to any
human being or to any other animal, by biting, clawing, attacking, lunging toward, growling,
barking, baring teeth or otherwise acts in a menacing manner toward or at any human being or
other animal, or if any of the aforementioned acts or conduct is attempted toward or at any
human being or other animal, it is a violation of this sectjon and the owner or custodian of said
vicious animal shall be guilty of a misdemeanor and fined no more than $750.00 plus $10.00
court costs if convicted.

B. Dangerous dog--Responsibilities. Upon conviction of an owner or custodian, by a
court of competent jurisdiction, of a vicious dog violation, such dog shall be considered a
'dangerous dog." When a dangerous dog is allowed to remain within the animal control
district, the following requirements shall be enforced.

C. No owner of a’dangerous dog shall permit such dog to go beyond the property of the
owner or keeper unless such dog is securely muzzled and physically restrained with a chain
having a minimum tensile strength of 300 pounds and not exceeding three feet in length.

D. When off the premises of the owner or keeper such dog shall be accompanied by a
competent person, physically capable of handling such dog.

E. While unattended on the owner's property, a dangerous dog shall be securely
confined, in a humane manner, indoors or in a securely enclosed and locked pen or structure
suitably designed to prevent the entry of young children and to prevent the dog from escaping.
The pen or dangerous animal run area must have all sides six feet high and a secure top. Ifthe
pen structure has no bottom secured to the sides, the sides must be embedded into the ground
no less than one foot.

F. The owner of a dangerous dog shall post warnings signs on the property where the
dog is kept that clearly visible and that inform persons that a dangerous dog is on the property.

G. No person shall possess with the intent to sell, offer for sale, breed, or buy or attempt
to buy, within the animal control district any dangerous dog.

H. Any dangerous dog may be immediately seized and impounded by an animal control



officer or police officer if the owner is in violation of this section. The owner shall be
responsible for the reasonable cost incurred by the city for the care of a dangerous dog
confiscated by the animal control officer or for the destruction of any dangerous dog if the
action by the city is pursuant to law and if the owner violated this section. Any such dog shall
be retained by the city pending the-order of an appropriate court.

L. In addition to any other penalty, a court may order the city to dispose of a dangerous
dog in an expeditious and humane manner.

J. Any dangerous dog found upon any property, public or private, not the premises of the
owner may, if such animal cannot be safely taken up and impounded by reasonable means, be
destroyed by the animal control or police officer.

K. The owner of a dangerous dog shall notify the city within 24 hours of the animal's
escape or release, that the animal is loose, unconfined, has attached another animal, or a
human being, has died or been given away. If the dangerous dog has been given away,
immediately upon the conveyance, the owner or keeper shall provide the animal control
shelter with the name, address and telephone number of the new owner. Upon conveyance,
the new owner, if he/she resides within the animal control district, will be obligated to comply
with the requirements of this chapter and section.

Section 2: This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and

approval and publication as required by law.

Passed and approved on firstreading the 1stday of November, 2016.
Passed and approved or{:seco}ld reading the 14th day of November, 2016.

Passed and approved on third and final reading the 6 th day of December, 2016.

Mayor

ATTEST:

City Clerk/Treasurer



ORDINANGE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING AND RE-ENACTING TITLE 15 OF
THE TORRINGTON MUNICIPAL CODE, 2006 2016 REVISIONS,
RELATING TO 2015 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODES.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF TORRINGTON, WYOMING:

Section 1. That Chapter 15.02.010 of the Revised Ordinances of the City of Torrington, Wyoming,
2006 2016 Revisions, be and it is hereby created to read as follows:

15.02.010 Building official--Generally.

There is created the office of the building official. The mayor shall designate a representative to
act as the building official.

15.02.020 Building official--Recordation.

The builglipg official shall keep complete records of all permits issued and inspections made and
other official work performed under the provisions of this title.

Sec.tion 2. That Chapter 15.04 of the Revised Ordinances of the City of Torrington, Wyoming, 2010
Revisions, be and it is hereby amended and re-enacted to read as follows:

15.04.010 Adoption of Uniform Codes by reference.

1. The purpose of this chapter is to protect the health and safety of the pubiic by
regulating the construction, alteration, repair, demolition, and moving of buildings and structures
within the city.

2. The following Codes in the editions noted are hereby adopted by reference with
certain amendments and deletions thereto found to be in the best interest of the residents of the
city:

A. 2006 2015 edition of the International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family
Dwellings;
2008 2015 edition of the International Building Code;
2008 2015 edition of the International Existing Building Code;
2008 2015 edition of the International Sign Code;
2008 2015 edition of the International Fire Code;
2006 2015 edition of the International Energy Conservation Code;
. 2006 2015 edition of the international Plumbing Code;
2008 2015 edition of the International Fuel Gas Code; and the
2006 2015 edition of the International Mechanical Code; all as published by the
International Code Council; and the
2008 2015 edition of the National Electrical Code, published by the National Fire
Protection Association; and the
K. 1997 edition of the Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, also
as published by the International Code Council

TIOMMUOm

=

16.04.020 Adoption.

The 2008 2015 International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings, including
Appendix Chapters E MANUFACTURED HOUSING USED AS DWELLINGS, F PASSIVE
RADON GAS CONTROL METHODS G PIPING STANDARDS FOR VARIOUS
APPLICATIONS, H PATIO COVERS, J EXITING BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES K SOUND
TRANSMISSION, L PERMIT FEES, and M HOME DAY CARE- R-3 OCCUPANCY N VENTING
METHODS R T STRAW-CLAY CONSTRUCTION S STRAWBALE CONSTRUCTION are
adopted by reference and have the same force and effect as though fully set forth in this chapter,
except as specifically amended by this chapter. Copies of such codes are on file in the office of
the Building Official.

15.04.030 Section R101.1 amended--Title.

The first paragraph of Section R101.1 is amended to read as follows:

These provisions shall be known as the Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings of
the City of Torrington, and shall be cited as such and will be referred herein as "this code."
15.04.040 Sections R102 through R114 amended--Administration.

Sections R102 through R114 are deleted in their entirety.

This code shall be administered in accordance with Chapter 1, Administration of the International



Building Code as adoptad and amendad by this chapter

15.04.050 Table R301.2 (1) amended--Climatic and geographic design criteria.
Table R301.2 (1), "Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria," is amended to read as follows:

Ground snow load = 30 psf (1.44 KN/m2 )

Wind speed = 90 mph (40 m/s) (3-second gust}, Exposure category "C"

Seismic design category = Site Class C

Weathering = Severe

Frost line depth = 44" 42"

Termite = none to slight

Decay = none to slight

Winter design temperature = -1° F (-18° degrees C)

lce shield underlayment required = No

Flood hazards = FIRM Community Panel #560023, December 11, 1985

Air freezing index = 1500

Mean annual temperature = 48.3° F (9.1° C)

15.04.060 Chapter 11 amended--Energy efficiency.
Chapter 11 is deleted in its entirety.

Buildings shall be designed and constructed in accordance with the 2006 2015 International
Energy Conservation Code.

%&WManWiW!@MWMWM
fmm@a%wmwammsmamm%wm
15.04.100 Section G2445.4 G2445 (621) amended—Unvented Room Heaters.

Section G2445.4-G2446.7 (621-4}-is-amended-toread-as-follows:

WW—W1M@WIMMWMM%WW
: _toiletrooms-or sterage-closets-

reamty—used-fer—sleeﬁmgﬁumms,—bam«ms—ta
Section G2445 (621) is amended to read as follows:



Unvented room heaters_ shall not be installed within residential occupancies, or within Groups A, E
and | occupancies, or within any sleeping room or room readily used for sleeping purposes, or in any
bathroom, toilet room or storage closet. Unvented room heaters may be installed in detached U

occupancies associated with residential occupancies. The location of unvented h
also comply with Section 303.3 of the 2015 IMC. manissmImn

[Correct the section number that changed between editions and dlarify that the intent]

15.04.110 Section P2603:6-4 P2603.5.1 amended--Sewer depth.
Add new sentence at the end of Section R2603.6-4 P2603.5.1 to read as follows;

All building sewers shail be a minimum of 44 42 inches (4448 1066.8 mm) below the finished
grade, unless existing conditions do not allow such depth, or shali be protected from freezing as
specifically approved by the building official.

[Correct the section number that changed between editions. ]

15.04.120 Section P2904.1 amended—Dwelling Unit Fire Sprinkler Systems
Replace the title and first sentence of Section P2904.1.1 to read as follows.

P2904.1.1 Reguired—sprinkiertocatiens: SPRINKLERS, Sprinklers—shalbe—instalied-to
pretect-aii-areas-of-a-dwelling-uptt: WHERE SPRINKLERS ARE INSTALLED AS AN OPTION,
THEY SHALL BE INSTALLED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THIS CODE TO PROTECT ALL AREAS
OF A DWELLING UNIT.

[Add new section and Deletes the requirement for fire sprinkfers in one-and-two family
dwellings and requires that any sprinkfers installed as an option must be installed to comply
with the code.]

15.04.125 P29804-4 P2904.5 amended--Water service pipe.
Saction P2804-4 P2906.4 is amended to read as follows:

Water service pipe shall be Eagle Pure-Care, CTS 200 psi @ 23° C, SDR 9, ASTM D2737, PE
3408, C3 AWWA C-901, or equal, with a minimum bury depth of 5-0" (1624 mm) for protection
against freezing. Piping shall terminate such that it will allow installation of a water meter within
5 feet (1524 mm) of where the piping enters the building or penetrates a slab on grade. Access
to the water meter must be provided within 5 feet, unless otherwise approved by the building
official.

[Corrects section numbers that changed between editions.]

15.04.130 Section P3103.1 amended--Vent terminals—-Roof extensions.
Section P3103.1 is amended to read as follows:

All open vent pipes which extend through a roof shall be terminated at |ea§t 12 inches (305 mm)
above the roof or 8 inches (152 mm) above the anticipated snow accumulation, except that where
a roof is to be used for any purpose other than weather protection, the vent extensions shall be

L]



Iun &t least 7 feet (2134 mm) above the roof,

15.04.140 Chapters 34 through 42 43 deleted--Electrical.

Chapters 33 34 through 42 43 of the International Residential Code are deleted in their entirety.
Electrical installations shall be as required by the National Electrical Code as adopted and
amended by this chapter.

[Corrects section numbers that changed between ediitions.]

15.04.150 Sections AE301 through AE303 amended--Permits.
Sections AE301 through AE303 are deleted in their entirety.

This code shall be administered in accordance with Chapter 1, Administration, of the International
Building Code, as adopted and amended by this chapter.

15.04.200 Adoption.

The 28086 2015 International Building Code, including Appendix Chapters C GROUP U-
AGRICULTURAL BUILDINGS, E SUPPLEMENTARY ACCESSIBILITY REQUIREMENTS, H
SIGNS, | PATIO COVERS, and J GRADING, are adopted by reference and have the same force
and effect as though fully set forth in this chapter, except as specifically amended by this Chapter.
Copies of such codes are on file in the office of the Building Official.

15.04.210 Section 101.1 amended--Title.
The first paragraph of Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows:

These regulations shall be known as the Building Code of the City of Torrington, hereinafter
referred to as "this code."

15.04.220 Section 102.4. amended--Referenced codes.

Section 102.4 is amended to read as follows:

The other codes listed in Sections 101.4.1 through 101.4.7 and referenced and amended
elsewhere in this code shall be considered part of the requirements of this code to the prescribed
extent of each such reference and amendment thereto.

[Not in Current code.]

15.04.250 Section 104.8 amended--Liability.
Add a new paragraph at the end of Section 104.8 to read as follows:

The city assumes no duty of care by virtue of the adoption or amen_‘\dmentA of this code. No person
is justified in relying upon the approval of a plan, the results‘cf an lqspectlon‘ or the issuance of a
certificate of inspection or occupancy, and such approvals, 1nspgg’non_s, and certlﬁt_:aias are nota
guarantee that the plan or work so approved, inspected or gertn‘:ed in fgct complies w1th_ all the
requirements of this code. It is the duty of the person owning, com_mlling, or construghpg any
building or structure to insure that the work is done in accordance with this code, and it is such
persons and not the city who are responsible for damages caused by negligent breach of such

duty.



194,299 Gection 106.2 amended—Work Exempt from Permit,

Add to the end of Section 105.5-2(1) (2) to read as follows:

(1) Floor area not greater than 320 sf to 200 sf.
(2) Fences not over 7 6 feet high.

[Aq’d new sgct/bn and Deletes the requirement for 120 sf to 200 sf. and removes fence
height requirement to comply with section 18.96.030 of the Torrington Municipal Code.]

15.04.260 Section 105.5 amended--Expiration.
Add a new paragraph to the end of Section 105.5 to read as follows:

I_Evgry‘ permit issued by the building official under the provisions of this code shall expire by
limitation and become null and void if the building or work authorized by such permit is not
completed and approved for occupancy within three years from the date the permit was issued,
or three years from the effective date of the ordinance codified under this section, whichever is
later. In order to renew or extend a permit, the applicant shall submit a new permit application
with all required submittal documents showing compliance with the codes in effect at the time the
new application is received. New permit and plan review fees may be prorated based on the
amount of work completed under a previous expired permit.

15.04.270 Section 108.3 amended--Temporary power.
Section 467-3 108.3 is amended to read as foliows:

The building official is authorized to give permission to temporarily supply and use power in part
of an electrical installation before such installation has been fully completed and approved. The
part covered by the temporary certificate shall comply with the requirements specified for
temporary lighting, heat or power in the National Electrical Code.

15.04.280 Section 408.2 108.2 amended--Schedule of permit fees.
Section 1082 109.2 is amended to read as follows:

The fee for each permit shall be as set forth in Appendix L of the International Residential Code.
The total building valuation may be reduced by the building official in an amount equal to the
valuation included under other permits issued for other elements or systems in the building or
structure.

408-2.14-109.2.1 Plan Review Fees: Plan review fees are separate fees and are independent
of the permit fees. Plan review fees shall be 67% of the permit fees listed in the referenced
Appendix L. When submittal documents are incomplete or changed so as to require
additional plan review, or when the project involves deferred submittal items, an additional
plan review fee shall be charged at the rate shown in the schedule. Not more than 80% of
plan review fees may be refunded after plan submittal but before any portion of the plan has
been reviewed. Plan reviews expire 180 days after comments are provided. After expiration,
the applicant shall resubmit plans and pay a new plan review fee.

408.2.2 109.2.2 Fee Credit; Building permit fees may be credited up to the value of the
plan review fee with the balance of the fee paid at the time of permit issuance.

408.2.3 108.2.3 Fee Refunds: 100% of fees which are erroneously paid or collected may
be refunded. Not more than 80% of a building permit fee may be refunded when no work
has been done under a permit issued in accordance with this code. Written requests for fee
refunds must be made not later than 180 days after the payment of the fee.

[Adds section numbers.]

15.04.290 Section 113 amended-—-Board of appeals.
Section 113 is amended to read as follows:

112.1 113.1 General. In order to hear and decide appeals of Administrative Enforcement Orders,
decisions or determinations made by the building official relative to the application of this qode,
there shall be and is hereby created a Board of Appeals. The Board of Appeals shall be appointed
by the governing body and shall hold office at its pleasure. The Board shall adopt rules of
procedure for conducting its business in accordance with the Administ_ratwe'Procedure Act under
the Wyoming State statutes. The membership of the Board shall consist of five persons, no fewer



{han firee of which shall be resicens of the ciy,

#4422 113.2 Limitations on authority. An application for appeal shall be based on a claim that the
true intent of this code or the rules legally adopted thersunder have been incorrectly interpreted,
the provisions of this code do not fully apply or an equally good or better form of construction is
proposed. The Board shall have no authority fo waive requirements of this code.

4—12-.3. 113.3 Qualifications. The Board of Appeals shall consist of members who are qualified by
experience and training to pass on matters pertaining to building construction and are not
employees of the jurisdiction.

[Corrects section numbers that changed between editions. ]

15.04.300 Section 443.4 114.1 amended--Unlawful acts.

Add sentence to the end of Section 443.4 114.1 to read as follows:
Violations of this code are punishable as provided by Chapter 1.12.030 of the Torrington Municipal
Code.

[Corrects section numbers that changed between editions.]

15.04.310 Section 1608.1 amended--Snow loads--General.
Section 1608.1 is amended to read as follows:

The minimum roof snow load shall be thirty pounds per square foot (1.44 kN/m2 ), but the design
roof load shall not be less than that determined by Section 1607.

15.04.320 Section 1608.2 amended--Ground snow loads.
Section 1608.2 is amended to read as follows:

The minimum ground snow loads to be used in determining the design snow loads for roofs shall
be 30 psf (1.44 kN/m2).

156.04.330 Section 1609.3 amended--Basic wind speed.
Section 1609.3 is amended to read as follows:

The basic wind speed (3-second gust) for the city shall be 90 mph (40 m/s), or as otherwise
determined by ASCE 7, Figure 6-1 when using the provisions of ASCE 7.

15.04.340 Section 1609.4 amended--Exposure category.
The first paragraph of Section 1609.4 is amended to read as follows:

For each wind direction considered, an exposure category that adequatel_y reflectg Fhe
characteristics of ground surface irregularities shall be determined for the site at which the building
or structure is to be constructed, however the exposure category shall be not less than Exposure
C.

15.04.350 Section 4805.2.1 1809.5 amended--Frost protection.
Add new sentence to the end of Section 4805.2.4 1809.5.1 to read as follows:
The minimum frost depth shall be not less than 44" 42"(1118 mm) below finished grade.

[Corrects section numbers that changed between editions. 7]




Ihe#ﬁ%%n@%&eﬁ&emmended-wﬂa@a&felm

Stmew;esemﬁng-mw#@%%nmemmwmdmm rahisns
Mﬂ%mﬁm*mwm-lmue—mmrwmﬁ-wﬁ%tien—wm

[No longer in coge]

15.04.380 Section J103.2 amended--Permits required--Exemptions.
Add exemption 8 to Section J103.2 to read as follows:

A gr_acjiljg permit is not required for subdivision development where an approved plan or
subdivision agreement is in place, or where written approval has otherwise been obtained for
work located entirely within a public right-of-way when approved by the city engineer.

16.04.400 Adoption.

The 2606 2015 International Existing Building Code is adopted by reference and has the same
force and effect as though fully set forth in this chapter, except as specifically amended by this
Chapter. Copies of such codes are on file in the office of the Building Official.

15.04.410 Section 101.1 amended--Title,
Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows:

These regulations shall be known as the Existing Building Code of the City of Torrington,
hereinafter referred to as "this code."

15.04.420 Section 101.2 amended--Scope.
Add new sentence to the end of Section 101.2 to read as follows:

The provisions of the National Electrical Code shall apply to the installation of electrical systems,
including alterations, repairs, replacement, equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and
appurtenances thereto. Wherever the term iCC Electrical Code appears in the code, it shall be
replaced with National Electrical Code.

15.04.430 Sections 103 through 115 amended--Administration.
Sections 103 through 115 is deleted in its entirety.

This code shall be administered in accordance with Chapter 1, Administration of the International
Building Code as adopted and amended by this chapter.

15.04.440 Section 420842 1401.2 amended--Compliance alternatives--Applicability.

The first sentence of Section 430+=2 1401.2 of the International Existing Building Code is
amended to read as follows.

Structures existing prior to April 02, 1963, in which there is work involving additions, alterations
or changes of occupancy, shall be made to conform to the requirements of this section or the
provisions of Chapters 4 through 42 13.

[Corrects section numbers that changed between editions & add chapter 13.]

15.04.500 Adoption.

The 2006 2015 International Fire Code, including Appendix B Fire Flow requirements C Fire
Hydrant Locations and Distribution D Fire Apparatus Access Roads E Hazard Categories, F
Hazard Ranking, G Cryogenic Fluids, | Fire Protection Systems-Non Complaint Conditions J
Building_Information Sign is adopted by reference and has the same force and effect as though
fully set forth in this chapter, except as specifically amended by this chapter. Copies of such codes
are on file in the office of the Building Official.

15.04.510 Section 101.1 amended--Title.

Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows:



These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the City of Torrington, hereinafter referred
to as "this code.”

15.04.520 Section 402.6 102,7 amended--Reference codes and standards.
Section 462.6 102.7 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

The referenced National Fire Protection Association (N FPA) standards listed in Chapter 45 80 of
the International Fire Code shall be the adopted standard for use within the jurisdiction. The most
recently published edition of each individual NFPA standard listed in Chapter 45 80 shall be
recognized as standards of good practice which may be enforced by the fire code official
!.vhene;ver other provisions of the code are, at the fire code official's discretion, inadequate or
|gapp||cable to any situation involving the protection of persons and property from the hazards of
fire or explosions. All references to the ICC Electrical Code shall be changed to the National
Electrical Code as adopted and amended by this chapter. referred to as "this code."

[Corrects section numbers that changed between editions and changed reference chapter
from 45 to 80.]

15.04.530 Section 103 amended--Department of Fire Prevention.
Section 402-6 103.1 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

The building official shall be responsible for the implementation, administration and enforcement of
the provision of this code. Everywhere the term “fire code official’ is used in this code the same shall
be meant to be the building official.

[Corrects section number.]

15.04.540 Section 104.1 amended--Enforcement.
Section 104.1 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

This code shall be enforced by the building official when not superseded by the State of Wyoming
Department of Fire Prevention and Electrical Safety.

15.04.550 Section 105 amended--Permits,
Section 105 is deleted in its entirety.

15.04.560 Section 107.6 amended--Overcrowding.
Section 107.6 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

Overcrowding or admittance of any person beyond the approved capacity of a building or a portion
thereof shall not be allowed. The fire code official or designee, upon finding any overcrowding
conditions or obstructions in aisles, passageways or other means of egress, or upon finding any
condition which constitutes a life safety hazard shall be authorized to cause the event to be
stopped until such condition or obstruction is corrected and/or a sworn peace officer may issue a
written citation of violation.

[Corrects section numbers that changed between editions. ]

15.04.570 Section 108.2 109.3 amended—Notice of violation.
Section 408:2 109.3 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

When the fire code official finds a building, premises, vehicle, storage, facility or outdoor area that is
in violation of this code, the fire code official or designee is authorized to prepare a writte_n notic_e of
violation describing the conditions deemed unsafe and, when compliance is not immediate,
specifying a time for re-inspection. If the violation is an immediate life safety hgzard. |n91ud|ng but
not limited to overcrowding or an obstructed egress pathway, the fire code official or designee may
request a sworn peace officer to issue a written citation of violation for nanjcomphance‘ in addition
to any other action, permitted under this code by the fire code official or designee.

[Corrects section numbers that changed between editions. ]

15.04.580 Section 108-3 109.4 amended--Violation penalties.



Section 408:3 10,4 is amended o read as follows;

Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to comply with any the requirements
thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in violation of the approved construction
documents or directive of the fire code official, or of a permit or certificate used under provisions
of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanoar, punishable by a fine not less than fifty dollars nor
more than seven hundred fifty dollars in accordance with Chapter 1.12.030 of the Torrington
Municipal Code. Each day that a violation continues shall be deemed a separate offense.

15.04.590 Section 111.4 amended--Failure to comply.
Section 111.4 is amended to read as follows:

Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with a stop work order, except
such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be
subject to the penalties prescribed by Chapter 1.12.030 of the Torrington Municipal Code.

15.04.600 Section 202 amended--General Definitions.
Section 202 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:
FIRE CODE OFFICIAL. The Building Official.

Look at Chapter 3 of the IFC Emergency Preparedness Requirements (All New)

16.04.610 Sections §08-3 §07.3 amended--Fire flow.
Section 508:3 507.3 is amended to read as follows:

A. An approved water supply capable of supplying required fire flow for fire protection shall
be provided to all premises upon which facilities, buildings or portions of buildings are hereafter
constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction. When any portion of the building protected is
in excess of 150 feet, as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the facility or
building, from a public street or approved fire department access roadway on which a water supply
meeting requirements is provided there shall be provided, when required by the Building Official,
on-site fire hydrants and mains capable of supplying the required fire flow.

B. Water supply may consist of reservoirs, pressure tanks, elevated tanks, water mains or
other fixed system capable of supplying their required fire flow. Minimum standards for fire flow
shall be as follows:

1. Zones CS, C1, C2, C3, I1, 12, and IP - 4,000 gallons per minute;
2. Zones R4, R5, R6, R6A, and C1A - 3,000 gallons per minute; and
3. Zones AL, RS, R1, R2, R2A, R3, and MP - 1,500 gallons per minute

[Corrects section numbers that changed between editions. ]

156.04.620 Sections §08:6 507.5 amended--Fire hydrant systems.
Section §08-6 507.5 is amended to read as follows:

A. The location, number and type of fire hydrants connected to a water supply capable of
delivering the required fire flow shall be provided on the public street or on the site of the premi§es
to be protected as required and approved by the Building Official. All hydrants shall be accessnple
to the fire department apparatus by roadways meeting the requirements of International Fire
Code.

B. Section 503 507.5 Minimum standards for placement and spacing of fire hydrants shall
be as follows:

1. Zones AL, RS, R1, R2, R2A, R3, and MP - no point on a city street or approved fire
department vehicle access roadway serving the structure shall be more than 400 feet
from a fire hydrant. Fire hydrants shall be placed no more than 800 feet apart.

2. Zones R4, R5, R6, R8A, and C1A - no point on a city street or approved fire department
vehicle access roadway serving the structure shail be more than 250 feet from a fire
hydrant. Fire hydrants shall be placed no more than 500 feet apart.

3. Zones CS, C1, C2, C3, 1, 2, and IP - no point on a city street or approved fire
department vehicle access roadway serving the structure shall be more than 200 feet



from a fire hydrant, Fire hydrants shall be placed no more than 400 feet apart,

4. Hydrants shall be placed at intersections whenever possible.
5. When on a divided highway, a hydrant shall be placed on each side of said highway.

8. Fire hydrants shail be placed no more than 1,000 feet apart along roadways serving
undeveloped areas whenever new water lines are laid or old water lines replaced.

7. Before any construction involving combustible materials in any subdivision may begin:

a. All fire hydrants shall be operational, shall have been flushed and operated, and
shall have been inspected and approved by City of Torrington Water or
Engineering Department inspectors; and

b. Streets shall be provided with all-weather driving surfaces able to support the
imposed weight fire department apparatus.

8. Fire hydrants shall be installed and maintained so that the breakaway flange is within
two inches of the finished grade.

9. The Building Official, or other fire code official as appointed and approved by the
Mayor, shall determine fire flow and duration requirements for structures based upon
standards contained in 2006 International Fire Code Appendix B and/or the Insurance
Service Office Commercial Grading Schedule. Installation and material specifications
for fire lines and fire hydrants shall be in accordance with Torrington Public Works
standards as determined by the City Engineer.

10. Appendix Chapters B (Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings) and C (Fire Hydrant
Locations and Distribution) of the 2006 International Fire Code shall be recognized as
standards of good practice which may be enforced by the Building Official, or other fire
code official as appointed and approved by the Mayor, whenever other provisions of
the code are, at the determining official's discretion, inadequate or inapplicable to any
situation involving the protection of persons and property from the hazards of fire or
explosions.

[Corrects section numbers that changed between editions.]

15.04.630 Section 3204-3-1-1 6504 amended--Storage--Location.
Add the following paragraph to the end of Section 3204-3:-4-4 5504.1 to read as follows:

The limite-in-which-the storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers is prohibited
in these zones are established as follows: AL, RS, R1, R2, R2A, R3, R4, R5, R6, R6A, MP, and
C1A zones.

[Corrects section numbers that changed between editions. ]

15.04.640 Section 3304.2.3 5601.2.3 amended--Permit restrictions--Storage of explosives
and blasting agents.

Section 330423 5601.2.3 is amended to read as follows:
Storage of explosives and blasting agents is prohibited within the corporate limits of the city.

[Corrects section numbers that changed between editions. ]

15.04.650 Section 3404.2.8.5.4 §704.2.9.5 amended--Storage--Locations where above-
ground tanks are prohibited.

Add the following paragraphs to the end of Section 3404-2.8.5-1 5704.2.9.5 to read as follows:

New bulk plants for the storage of flammabie or combustible fiquids are prohibited within the area
within any AL, RS, R1, R2, R2A, R3, R4, R5, R6, R6A, MP, and C1A zones.

. W . ’ ks
The limits where the storage of flammable or combustible liquids in outside above ground tan
is prohibited, are established as the area within any AL, RS, R1, R2, R2A, R3, R4, R5, R6, R6A,

MP, and C1A zones.

10



[Carrects section mumbers that changed between edtors,]

15.04.660 Section 3406-2:4-4 §706 amended--Special operations--Locations where above-
ground tanks are prohibited.

Add the following paragraphs to the end of Section 3406.2.4.4 5706.2.4.4 to read as follows:

Nfevy bulk plants for the storage of flammable or combustible liquids are prohibited within the area
within any AL, RS, R1, R2, R2A, R3, R4, R5, R6, R6A, MP, and C1A zones.

j'he limits where the storage of flammable or combustible liquids in outside above-ground tanks
is prohibited, are established as the area within any AL, RS, R1, R2, R2A, R3, R4, R5, R, R6A,
MP, and C1A zones.

[Corrects section numbers that changed between editions.]

15.04.670 Section 3406.4 5706.4 amended--Bulk plants or terminals.
Add the following paragraph to the end of Section 3408-4 5706.4 to read as follows:

New bulk plants for the storage of Class | or Class Il liquids are prohibited within the area within
any AL, RS, R1, R2, R2A, R3, R4, R5, R6, R6A, MP, and C1A zones.

[Corrects section numbers that changed between editions.]

156.04.680 Section 3804.2 6104.2 amended--Location of containers--Maximum capacity
within established limits.

Add the following paragraph to the end of Section 38042 6104.2 to read as follows:

The geographic limits as to the storage of liquefied petroleum gas is restricted for the protection
of heavily populated or congested areas are established as follows: AL, RS, R1, R2, R2A, R3,
R4, R5, R6, R6A, MP, and C1A zones. Containers of liquefied petroleum gas in these zones shall
not exceed 100 gallons.

[Corrects section numbers that changed between editions. ]

15.04.700 Adoption.

The 20086 2015 International Energy Conservation Code is adopted by reference and has the
same force and effect as though fully set forth in this chapter, except as specifically amended by
this Chapter. Copies of such codes are on file in the office of the Building Official.

15.04.710 Section 101.1 amended--Title.
Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows:

The regulations shall be known as the Energy Conservation Code of the City of Torrington, and
shall be cited as such. lt is referred to herein as "this code."

[No longer in code.]

15.08.010 Adoption.

The 2006 2015 International Plumbing Code, including Appendix Ch?pters E, is adopted by
referance and have the same force and effect as though fully set forth in this chapter, except as

11



g[:fgiﬂf&”}’ amended Dy this chapter, Copies of such cades are on file in the office of the Building
iciat.

15.08.020 Section 101.1 amended--Titie.
Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows:

These regulations shall be known as the International Plumbing Code of the City of Torrington
hereinafter referred to as "this code.”

15.08.030 Section 108.4 amended--Violation penalties.
Section 108.4 is amended to read as follows:

Any person who violates a provision of this code or fails to comply with any the requirements thereof
or who shall erect, install, alter or repair plumbing work in violation of the approved construction
documents or directive of the code official shall be subject to the penalties prescribed by Chapter
01.12.030 of the Torrington Municipal Code. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has
been served shall be deemed a separate offense.

16.08.040 Section 108.5 amended--Stop work orders.
Section 108.5 is amended to read as follows:

Any person who shall continue any work in or about a structure after having been served with a stop
work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe
condition, shall be subject to the penalties prescribed by the Torrington Municipal Code.

15.08.050 Section 603.2 amended--Separation of water service and building sewer.
Add a new sentence after the exceptions to Section 603.2 to read as follows:

The minimum separation of the water service and building sewer at the property line shall be in
accordance with the City of Torrington standards.

Stay or go with what's in the code?

15.08.060 Section 605.3 amended--Water service pipe.
Add the following paragraph to the end of Section 605.3 of the International Plumbing Code.

Water service pipe shall be Eagle Pure-Core, CTS 200 psi @ 23° C, SDR 9, ASTM D2737, PE
3408, C3 AWWA C-901, or equal, with a minimum bury depth of 5'-0" (1,524 mm) for protection
against freezing. Such piping shall terminate such that it will allow installation of a water meter within
5 feet (1,524 mm) of where the piping enters the building or penetrates a slab on grade. Access to
the water meter must be provided within 5 feet, unless otherwise approved by the building official.

15.08.070 Section 610 amended--Disinfection of potable water system.
Section 610 is deleted in its entirety.

15.08.075 Section 703.3 amended- Sanitary and Storm Sewers.
Section 703.3 is amended to read as follows:

Where separate systems of sanitary drainage and storm drainage are installed in the same property, the
sanitary and storm building sewers or drains shail not be permitted to be laid side by side in one trench.
There pipes shall have a min of 5* separation in all directions.

15.08.080 Section 703.6 amended- Combined Sanitary and Storm Public Sewers.
Section 703.6 is amended to read as follows:

Combined Sanitary and Storm Public Sewers is prohibited within the corporate limits of the city

Add New Chapters 13-14
15.08.100 Adoption.

The 2006 2015 Intemational Fuel Gas Code, is adopted by reference and has the same force apd
effect as though fully set forth in this chapter, except as specificaily amended by this chapter. Copies
of such codes are on file in the office of the Building Official.

12



15.08.110 Section 101.1 amended--Title.
Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows:

These regulations shall be known as the Fuel Gas Code of the City of Torrington hereinafter referred
to as "this code."

15.08.120 Sections 103 through 104--Administration.
Sections 103 through 104 of the International Fuel Gas Code are deleted in their entirety.

The intentio_n is that this code be administered in accordance with the administrative provisions of
the International Building Code, as adopted and amended by this title.

15.08.130 Section 108.4 amended--Violation penaities.
Section 108.4 is amended to read as follows:

Any person who violates a provision of this code or fails to comply with any the requirements thereof
or who shall erect, install, aiter, use or repair plumbing work in violation of the approved construction
documents or directive of the code official shall be subject to the penalties prescribed by the
Torrington Municipal Code. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served
shall be deemed a separate offense.

15.08.140 Section 108.5 amended--Stop work orders.

Section 108.5 is amended to read as follows:

Any person who shall continue any work in or about a structure after having been served with a stop
work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe
condition, shall be subject to the penalties prescribed by the Torrington Municipal Code.

15.08.150 Section 109.1 amended--Means of appeal--General.
Section 109.1 is amended to read as follows:

General. In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the
building officiai relative to the application and interpretation of the code, there shall be and is hereby
created a board of appeals. The board of appeals shall be appointed by the governing body and
shall hold office at its pleasure. The board shall adopt rules of procedure for conducting its business.
The board shall be known as the Building Code Board of Appeals.

Limitations on authority. An application for appeal shall be based on a claim that the true intent of
this code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been incorrectly interpreted, the provisions of
this code do not fully apply or an equally good or better form of construction is proposed. The board
shall have no authority to waive requirements of this code.

The board of appeals shall consist of members who are qualified by experience and training to pass
on matters pertaining to building construction and are not employees of the jurisdiction.

15.08.160 Sections 109.2 through 109.7 amended--Means of appeal.
Sections 109.2 through 109.7 are deleted in their entirety.

15.08.170 Section 621.4 amended--Prohibited locations.
Section 621.4 is amended to read as follows:

Unvented room heaters shall not be installed within residential occupancies, or within Groups A, E
and | occupancies, or within any sleeping room or room readily used for sleeping purposes, or inany
bathroom, toilet room or storage closet. Unvented room heaters may be installed in detached U
occupancies associated with residential occupancies. The location of unvented room heaters shall
also comply with Section 303.3.

15.08.200 Adoption.

The 2006 2015 Intemnational Mechanical Code, including Appendix A, is adopted b_y reference and
has the same force and effect as though fully set forth in this chapter, except as ggecrﬁcally amended
by this chapter. Copies of such codes are on file in the office of the Building Official.

15.08.210 Section 101.1 amended--Title.

Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows:

13



These regulations shall be known as the Mechanical Code of the City of Torrington hereinafter
referred to as "this code."

15.0;.220 Sectlons 103 and 104 amended--Administration.
Sections 103 and 104 of the International Mechanical Code are deleted in their entirety. Itis intended

that the code be administered in accordance with the international Building Code, as adopted and
amended by this title.

15.08.230 Section 108.4 amended--Violation penalities.
Section 108.4 is amended to read as follows:

Any person who violates a provision of this code or fails to comply with any the requirements thereof
or who shall erect, install, alter, use or repair mechanical work in violation of the approved
construction documents or directive of the code official shall be subject to the penalties prescribed
by Chapter 1.12.030 of the Torrington Municipal Code. Each day that a violation continues after due
notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense.

15.08.240 Section 108.5 amended--Stop work orders.
Section 108.5 is amended to read as follows:

Any person who shall continue any wark in or about a structure after having been served with a stop
work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe
condition, shall be subject to the penalties prescribed by Chapter 1.12.030 of the Torrington
Municipal Code.

15.08.250 Section 109.1 amended--Means of appeal--General.
Section 109.1 is amended to read as follows:

General. In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the
building official relative to the application and interpretation of the code, there shall be and is hereby
created a board of appeals. The board of appeals shall be appointed by the governing body and
shall hold office at its pleasure. The board shall adopt rules of procedure for conducting its business.
The board shall be known as the Building Code Board of Appeals.

16.08.260 Section 109.1.1 amended--Limitations on authority.
Section 109.1.1 is amended to read as follows:

Limitations on authority. An application for appeal shall be based on a claim that the true intent of
this code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been incorrectly interpreted, the provisions of
this code do not fully apply or an equally good or better form of construction is proposed. The board
shall have no authority to waive requirements of this code.

15.08.270 Section 109.2 amended--Qualifications.
Section 109.2 is amended to read as follows:

Qualifications. The board of appeals shall consist of members who are qualified by experience and
training to pass on matters pertaining to building construction and are not employess of the
jurisdiction.

15.08.280 Sections 109.2 through 109.7 amended--Means of appeal.
Sections 109.2 through 108.7 are deleted in their entirety.

15.08.300 Section 304.7 301.10 amended--Electrical.
Section 3047 301.10 of the International Mechanical Code is amended to read as follows:

Electrical wiring, and controls and connections to equipment and appliances regulated by this code
shall be in accordance with the National Electrical Code.

[Corrects section numbers that changed between editions. The National Electrical Code is
adopted by reference by this ordinance.]

Section 4. That Chapter 15.12 of the Revised Ordinances of the City of Tarrington, Wyoming, 2010
Revisions, be and it is hereby amended and re-enacted to read as follows:

15.12,010 Adoption.

14



The 2968 2019 National Electrical Gode is adopled by reference and has the same force and

effegt as though fully set forth in this chapter, except as specifically amended by this chapter.
Copies of such codes are on file in the office of the Building Official.

15.12.020 Article 90.4 amended--Enforcement.
Article 80.4 of the National Electrical Code is amended to read as follows:

Th!s gode shall be administered in accordance with Chapter 1, Administration, of the International
Bu_lld_mg Code as adopted and amended by this Chapter. Fees shall be as indicated by the
building permit and plan review fee schedule.

15.12.030 Article 230.2(B) amended--Special occupancies.
Add Subsection 3 to Article 230.2(B) to read as follows:

Fire areas separated by a minimum two-hour fire wall as defined by the building code may be
considered as separate buildings for the purpose of calculating the number of services when
approved in advance by the building official.

te-becoiled-ipthejunstion-box-forconnection-by-the-slectris-utility-Arn-expansion-jeint-must-be

[Removes an unnecessary requirement for protection of conductors where ground
settling may occur.]
15.12.050 Permits.

Permits for the installation, alteration and repair of electrical wiring, appliances or equipment, shall
be as required by the State of Wyoming Department of Fire Prevention and Electrical Safety and
shail be issued only to a person meeting the requirements set forth by that agency for the work
being conducted.

Section 5. That Chapter 15.16 of the Revised Ordinances of the City of Torrington, Wyoming, 2010
Revisions, be and it is hereby amended and re-enacted to read as follows:
16.16.100 Adoption.

The 1997 Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings is adopted by refersnce and
has the same force and effect as though fully set forth in this chapter, except as specifically
amended by this Chapter. Copies of such codes are on file in the office of the Building Official.

45.16.110 Section 101.1 amended--Title.
Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows:

These regulations shall be known as the Code for Abatement of Dangerous Buildings of the City
of Torrington, hereinafter referred to as "this code."

15.16.120 Section 201.3 amended--Right-of-entry.
Add new sentence to the end of the first paragraph of Section 201.3 to read as follows:

In cases of emergency where there is believed to be imminent danger to any person the building
official may enter any property to make any necessary inspections under this code or to take any
other action authorized by this code without permission or warrant.

15,16.130 Section 203 amended--Violations.
Add hew sentence to the end of Section 203 to read as follows:
No owner or person having charge or control over any building or premises shall fail to comply

15



With any order issyed o such Person under this code.

15.16.140 Section 302 amended--Dangerous building.
The first sentence of Section 302 is amended to read as follows:

For the purposes of this code, any building or structure which has any or all of the conditions or
defects hereinafter described shall be considered to be a dangerous building.

15.16.150 Section 401.2 4. Amended--Notice and order.
Subsection 4 of Section 401.2 is amended to read as follows:

Statements advising that if any required repair or demolition work (without vacation also being
required) is not commenced within the time specified, the building official (i) will order the building
vacated and posted to prevent further occupancy until the work is completed, (i) may proceed to
cause the work to be done and charge the costs thereof against the property or its owner, and (jii)
may cause a summons and complaint to be served upon the property owner or any person having
charge or control over the building or premises for failure to make the required repairs or
demolition within the specified time.

16.16.160 Section 801.1 amended--Performance of work of repair or demolition--
Procedure.

Section 801.1 is amended fo read as follows:

When any work of repair or demolition is to be done pursuant to Section 701.3, Item 3, of this
code, the building official shall arrange to have the work performed by personnel of this jurisdiction
or by private contract under direction of the building official. Plans and specifications therefore
may be prepared by the building official, or the building official may employ such architectural or
engineering assistance on a contractual basis as deemed necessary. If any of the work is to be
accomplished by private contract, standard public works contractual procedures shall be followed,
unless such work is deemed to be an emergency.

15.16.170 Section 801.2 amended--Costs.
Section 801.2 is amended to read as follows:

A statement of the cost of such work, plus fifteen percent for administrative overhead, shall be
billed to the record owner of the property. If not paid within thirty days of the billing it shall be
transmitted to the city council who, upon approval, shall cause the same to be paid as a special
assessment against the property. Costs incurred shall be paid out of the city treasury. Such costs
shall be charged to the owner of the property or premises involved as a special assessment on
the land on which the building or structure is located, and shall be collected in the manner
prescribed for special assessments.

15.16.180 Section 802 amended--Repair and demolition fund.
Section 802 is deleted in its entirety.

15.16.190 Chapter 9 amended--Recovery of cost of repair or demolition.
Chapter 9 is deleted in its entirety.

Section 6. That Chapter 15.21 of the Revised Ordinances of the City of Torrington, Wyoming,
2010 Revisions, be and it is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 7. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and approval
and publication as required by law.

Passed and approved on first reading this 1% day of November, 2016.
Passed and approved on second reading this 14% day of November, 2016.

Passed and approved on third reading this 6% day of December, 2016.

16



Mike Varney, Mayor
ATTEST:

Lynn Kinnan, Deputy City Clerk

17



2017 GOLF RATES

rd

Junior/Student 9 153,00 | $ 153.00
Single $ 423.00 | $ 459.00
Couple $ 637.00 | $ 673.00
*Family $ 71200 | $ 750.00
[College Student (12 Credit Hours) Under 26 Years of age $ 153.00 | $ 153.00
Senior 60 Years and Older $ 400.00 | $ 428,00
" Daily Fees
9 Holes (7 days a week) $ 17.00 | § 17.00
18 Holes (7 days a week) $ 27.00 | $ 27.00
Tourmaments
Weekdays - Guest $ 16.00 | $ 16.00
[Weekends - Guest $ 2100 | $ 21,00
Trail Fees
Annual License $ 175.00 | § 175.00
Daily 9 15.00 [ $ 15.00
Golf Cart Rental
9 Holes (Per Rider) $ 8.00 | % 8.00
18 Holes (Per Rider) $ 1200 | § 12.00
East & West Golf Cart Sheds
Gas $ 12500 | § 125.00
Electric 3 150.00 | $ 150.00
Driving Range Fees
Couple Range Fees $ 27000 | $ 270.00
“Family Range Pass $ 310.00 [ § 310.00
Junior Range Pass 3 133.00 | $ 133.00
Annual Adult (One person range pass) $ 220.00 | $ 220.00
College Student (Under age 26) 12 credit hours $ 158.00 | $ 158.00
Bucket Balls
Large (60) $ 6.00 [ $ 6.00
Small (30) $ 4.00 | $ 4.00

*Family members 18 years and under living at home, not maried (annual family golf and range pass)




CITY OF TORRINGTON

Payment Approval Report - Council
Report dates: 10/19/2016-10/28/2016

Page: 1
Oct 28, 2016 02:27PM

Report Criteria:
Detail report
Invoices with totals above $0.00 included
Paid and unpaid invoices included.

Vendor Vendor Name Invoice Number  Type Description GL Account# Invoice Date Invoice Amt  Amount Paid  Date Paid
21ST CENTURY EQUIPMENT LLC
1002 21ST CENTURY EQUIPM  P24628 Invoi  grease x2 51-75-660 10/25/2016 6.10 .00
Total 21ST CENTURY EQUIPMENT LLC: 6,10 .00
AIR-SYSTEMS ENGINEERING, INC.
1259 AIR-SYSTEMS ENGINEE 10266 Invoi  combustion adjmnt to pool boiler 57-40-710 10/21/2016 264.00 .00
Total AIR-SYSTEMS ENGINEERING, INC : 26400 00
BELL LUMBER & POLE COMPANY
1700 BELL LUMBER & POLE C  INV59077 Invol  wood utility pole-stock x20 53-14100 10/03/2016 5,360.00 .00
Total BELL LUMBER & POLE COMPANY: 5,360.00 .00
BENCHMARK OF TORRINGTON
1710 BENCHMARK OF TORRIN 21016 Invoi  city shop dentention pond cnstretn 10-61-330 10/04/2016 3,721.50 .00
Total BENCHMARK OF TORRINGTON: 3,721.50 .00
BLOEDORN LUMBER COMPANY-TORRINGTON
1826 BLOEDORN LUMBER CO 3256488 Invoi  landscpe timber, yard edging, bit, 51-75-760 10/05/2016 10.98 .00
1826 BLOEDORN LUMBER CO 3258468 Invoi  4x4-12' treated lumber x 2 10-52-700 10/06/2016 38.60 .00
1826 BLOEDORN LUMBER CO 3258536 Invoi  bolts x 2 10-52-700 10/06/2016 4.98 .00
1826 BLOEDORN LUMBER CO 3259521 Invoi  carriage bolt 10-52-700 10/07/2016 249 00
1826 BLOEDORN LUMBER CO 3260410 Invoi 200 hook ceiling track X 5cd 10-52-700 10/07/2016 13.45 00
1826 BLOEDORN LUMBER CO 3285145 Invoi  pop-up half sprinkler head x 2 10-52-700 10/10/2016 10.98 .00
1826 BLOEDORN LUMBER CO 3269119 Invoi 4" grinding wheel x4 51-75-220 10/12/2016 14.36 00
1826 BLOEDORN LUMBER CO 3271364 Invoi  garden hoe 10-52-700 10/13/2016 999 .00
1826 BLOEDORN LUMBER CO 3282125 Invoi  mop head & mop 10-52-700 10/19/2016 11.69 .00
Total BLOEDORN LUMBER COMPANY-TORRINGTON: 117.52 .00
BOMGAARS SUPPLY INC
1900 BOMGAARS SUPPLY INC 54234831 Invoi  rv antifreeze x3 57-40-700 09/16/2016 8.97 .00
1900 BOMGAARS SUPPLY INC 54234937 Invoi  screws 53-82-770 09/16/2016 879 00
1900 BOMGAARS SUPPLY INC 54235942 Invoi  starting fluid 10-60-660 09/20/2016 5.98 00
1900 BOMGAARS SUPPLY INC 54236739 Invoi  hydraulfic fluid x2 54-40-710 09/23/2016 35.98 00
1900 BOMGAARS SUPPLY INC 54236768 Invoi  ball valve, bushing 51-75-765 09/23/2016 27.68 00
1900 BOMGAARS SUPPLY INC 54238931 Invoi  starter fertilizer 10-52-700 09/30/2016 10.99 .00
1900 BOMGAARS SUPPLY INC 54239685 Invoi  packaged kerosene x 2 54-40-660 10/03/2016 69.98 .00
1900 BOMGAARS SUPPLY INC 54240028 Invoi  bait station, trap 56-40-700 10/04/2016 14.98 .00
1900 BOMGAARS SUPPLY INC 54240291 Invoi rv antifreeze x24, clevis, caster, in  56-40-700 10/05/2016 124.69 .00
1900 BOMGAARS SUPPLY INC 54240553 Invoi  twist tie, chisel 52-40-220 10/06/2016 18.98 00
1900 BOMGAARS SUPPLY INC 54240820 Invoi  stones, rplcmnt chains, floor jack, 54-45-220 10/07/2016 221.95 00
1900 BOMGAARS SUPPLY INC 54242315 Invoi  antifreeze x6/winterize bathrooms 10-65-700 10/12/20186 23.94 .00
Total BOMGAARS SUPPLY INC: 572.91 .00
CANON FINANCIAL SERVICES, INC
2141 CANON FINANCIAL SERV 16596489 Invoi  reoccuring copier contract 006-co 53-81-500 10/13/2016 180.00 00
2141 CANON FINANCIAL SERV 16596489A Invoi  reoccuring copier contract 006-co 53-81-500 10/13/2016 180.00 00
2141 CANON FINANCIAL SERV 165964898 Invoi  documentation fee-court copier 53-81-500 10/13/2016 85.00 00




CITY OF TORRINGTON

Payment Approval Report - Council
Report dates: 10/19/2016-10/28/2016

Page: 2

Oct 28, 2016 02:27PM

Vendor Vendor Name Invoice Number Type Description GL Account # Invoice Date Invoice Amt Amount Paid  Date Paid
Total CANON FINANCIAL SERVICES, INC: 445.00 .00
CHICAGO LUMBER COMPANY OF OMAHA
2290 CHICAGO LUMBER COM 2761350 Invoi residential smoke alarms x24 10-55-730 10/21/2016 84.00 .00
Total CHICAGO LUMBER COMPANY OF OMAHA: 84.00 .00
CITIBANK, N.A.
2372 CITIBANK, N.A. 38090T Invoi filler capx2, 18" bar, chain 59-40-710 10/10/2016 85.96 .00
Total CITIBANK, N.A.: 85.96 .00
CITY OF TORRINGTON
2375 CITY OF TORRINGTON 101916 Invoi  payroll withholding-c.powell,m.joh 10-22790 10/19/2016 32.01 32.01 10/19/2016
2375 CITY OF TORRINGTON 101916A Invoi  payroll withholding -golf 10-22790 10/19/2016 70.00 70.00 10/19/2016
2375 CITY OF TORRINGTON 101916B Invoi  payroll withholding -utilities 10-22790 10/19/2016 138.52 138.52 10/19/2016
Total CITY OF TORRINGTON: 240.53 240.53
CITY OF TORRINGTON c/o PINNACLE BANK
6125 CITY OF TORRINGTONc¢/ 1116HEALTH Invoi  11/16 health reserve non-insured 10-22760 10/25/2016 11,157.07 11,157.07 10/26/2016
Total CITY OF TORRINGTON c/o PINNACLE BANK: 11,157.07 11,157.07
CITY SERVICE VALCON LLC
2373 CITY SERVICE VALCON L 0155607 Invoi 6000 gallons Aviation Gas 55-40-670 10/24/2016 20,842.15 .00
Total CITY SERVICE VALCON LLC: 20,842.15 .00
COLLER INDUSTRIES INCORPORATED
2480 COLLER INDUSTRIES IN  481324A Invoi name tags-bunker gear locker roo 10-55-830 10/20/2016 114,75 .00
Total COLLER INDUSTRIES INCORPORATED: 114.75 oo
DANA KEPNER COMPANY, INC
2901 DANA KEPNER COMPAN 2224441-00 Invoi safety break couplingx2 set screw 51-75-760 10/07/2016 15500 00
2901 DANA KEPNER COMPAN  2224467-00 Invoi 12" pvc check valve, 12"couplingx 52-40-730 10/13/2016 351.00 .00
2901 DANA KEPNER COMPAN  2224474-00 Invoi  extension sections for 5-1/4" hyds 51-75-760 10/13/2016 328.11 00
2901 DANA KEPNER COMPAN  2224474-01 Invoi  extension sectionsx3 51-75-760 10/19/2016 1,115.54 00
2901 DANA KEPNER COMPAN  2224474-02 Invoi 12" extension barrel 51-75-760 10/25/2016 320.00 .00
2901 DANA KEPNER COMPAN  2224512-00 Invoi 1" brass plugx12, 6x1" saddlex2 51-14100 10/20/2016 322.00 00
2901 DANA KEPNER COMPAN  2224512-01 Invoi 1" insert stiffner x 100 51-14100 10/25/2016 225.00 .00
2901 DANA KEPNER COMPAN  2224529-00 Invoi 6" hyd ext for 4-1/2" centurion 51-75-760 10/20/2016 321.23 .00
2901 DANA KEPNER COMPAN  2224541-00 Invoi 4" stargrip os rest for dip w/access 51-14100 10/17/2016 780.00 .00
2901 DANA KEPNER COMPAN  2224583-00 Invoi  mtr flangesX15,24gskts, 50washer 51-73-790 10/26/2016 782.15 .00
Total DANA KEPNER COMPANY, INC: 4,700.03 00
DENT, DAVID A
3012 DENT, DAVID A 101916 Invoi  golf pro payable 56-20300 10/19/2016 1,289.00 1,289.00 10/19/2016
Total DENT, DAVID A: 1,289.00 1,289.00
DON HAUGHT INC
3151 DON HAUGHT INC 17662620 Invoi  unplugged kitchen sink 10-55-700 10/15/2016 207.50 .00




CITY OF TORRINGTON

Payment Approval Report - Council
Report dates: 10/19/2016-10/28/2016

Page: 3

Oct 28, 2016 02:27PM

Vendor Vendor Name Invoice Number Type Description GL Account # Invoice Date Invoice Amt Amount Paid  Date Paid
Total DON HAUGHT INC: 207.50 .00
ELXS!
3413 ELXSI 468786 Invoi gxp software enhanced support pl 52-40-300 10/26/2016 1,800.00 .00
Total ELXSI: 1,800.00 .00
EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS INC
3448 EMERGENCY MEDICAL P 1860865 Invoi  king airways 2.5 x 3 58-40-890 10/18/2016 98.85 .00
Total EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS INC: 98.85 00
ENERGY LABORATORIES, INC
3458 ENERGY LABORATORIE 34915 Invoi  lab testing / pwsid 5600164C 51-72-420 10/17/2016 72.00 .00
3458 ENERGY LABORATORIE 34939 Invoi  lab testing / process control 51-72-420 10/17/2016 27.00 .00
3458 ENERGY LABORATORIE 34942 Invoi lab testing / process control 52-40-830 10/17/2016 176.00 .00
3458 ENERGY LABORATORIE 34943 Invoi  lab testing-outfail / permit WY002 52-40-830 10/17/2016 206.00 .00
3458 ENERGY LABORATORIE 34944 Invoi lab test/process control-prison effl 52-40-830 10/17/2016 226.00 .00
3458 ENERGY LABORATORIE 34960 Invoi  lab testing / pwsid 5600164C 51-72-420 10/17/2016 27.00 .00
Total ENERGY LABORATORIES, INC: 734.00 .00
EVERGREEN CAISSONS, INC
10080 EVERGREEN CAISSONS, 101716 Invoi  water meter deposit return 51-22910 10/17/2016 1,400.00 .00
10080 EVERGREEN CAISSONS, 101716 Invoi  water usage 51-37-110 10/17/2016 921.63- .00
Total EVERGREEN CAISSONS, INC: 478.37 00
FAMILY SUPPORT REGISTRY
3565 FAMILY SUPPORT REGIS 101916 Invoi  PAYROLL WITHHOLDING 10-22705 10/19/2016 235.97 23597 10/19/2016
Total FAMILY SUPPORT REGISTRY: 235.97 23597
FARWEST LINE SPECIALTIES,LLC
3572 FARWEST LINE SPECIAL 219447 Invoi  septor water-resistant head lamp 53-82-670 10/17/2016 234.71 00
3572 FARWEST LINE SPECIAL 219638 Invoi  balaclava, fleece cap, knit beanie 53-82-530 10/20/2016 471.96 .00
Total FARWEST LINE SPECIALTIES LLC: 706.67 .00
FERGUSON ENTERPRISES INC
3595 FERGUSON ENTERPRIS 0644632 Invoi  bonet repair kit-hydrant rpr parts 51-75-760 10/19/2016 498.75 .00
Total FERGUSON ENTERPRISES INC: 49875 .00
GE BETZ, INC
3838 GEBETZ, INC 98455764 Invoi  chemical management-prison 51-75-765 10/08/2016 7,748.79 7,748.79  10/26/2016
Total GE BETZ, INC: 7,748,779 7.748.79
GOSHEN COUNTY SENIOR FRIENDSHIP
3970 GOSHEN COUNTY SENI 101916 Invoi  annual matching funds contributio 10-67-220 10/19/2016 9,000.00 0o
Total GOSHEN COUNTY SENIOR FRIENDSHIP: 9,000.00 00
GREAT-WEST LIFE & ANNUITY INSURANCE CO
4075 GREAT-WEST LIFE & AN 101916 Invoi  payroll withholding 10-22800 10/19/2016 1,575.62 1,575.62  10/19/2016




CITY OF TORRINGTON

Payment Approval Report - Council
Report dates: 10/19/2016-10/28/2016

Page: 4
Oct 28, 2016 02:27PM

Vendor Vendor Name Invoice Number Type Description GL Account # Invoice Date Invoice Amt Amount Paid  Date Paid
Total GREAT-WEST LIFE & ANNUITY INSURANCE CO: 1,575.62 1,675.62
HAROLD, STEVE
59 HAROLD, STEVE 102016 Invoi double cemetery lot sold back to ¢ 59-30-100 10/20/2016 700.00 .00
Total HAROLD, STEVE: 700.00 .00
HAWKINS, INC
4376 HAWKINS, INC 3965915 Invoi  Sdm hydrxde-52gal,55gal blue dr 52-40-820 10/12/2016 1,002.60 00
Total HAWKINS, INC: 1,002.60 .00
HD SUPPLY FACILITIES MAINTENANCE LTD
4354 HD SUPPLY FACILITIES 084763 Invoi  diffusr install bushingx160 52-40-700 10/13/2016 1,262.10 00
Total HD SUPPLY FACILITIES MAINTENANCE LTD: 1,262.10 .00
HEALTHSMART BENEFIT SOLUTIONS, INC
4385 HEALTHSMART BENEFIT 8821116 Invoi PAYROLL WITHHOLDING-Unit#8 10-22770 10/26/2016 208.00 208.00 10/26/2016
Total HEALTHSMART BENEFIT SOLUTIONS, INC: 208.00 208.00
HYATT, CHARLES H
4558 HYATT, CHARLES H 2016MARKING Invoi 2016 markings project/striping 10-60-790 10/25/2016 828.90 .00
Total HYATT, CHARLES H: 828.90 .00
INBERG-MILLER ENGINEERS
4657 INBERG-MILLER ENGINE 16872CW06 Invoi  Landfill #2 - design & permit rene 54-45-740 10/10/2016 61,200.12 .00
Total INBERG-MILLER ENGINEERS: 61,200.12 .00
KAUFMAN, LARRY A.
4940 KAUFMAN, LARRY A 112795 Invoi 1 pc gray plastic-installed 58-40-680 10/24/2016 30.00 .00
Total KAUFMAN, LARRY A : 30.00 .00
LORMAN BUSINESS CENTER, INC
5258 LORMAN BUSINESS CEN 3025653-1 Invoi  wy contrcts & procurement regma  51-75-690 10/14/2016 9573 .00
Total LORMAN BUSINESS CENTER, INC: 9573 00
MATTHEWS, CANDICE
57 MATTHEWS, CANDICE 18.01067.11 10 Invoi final billing - deposit return 53-22900 10/19/2016 91.04 .00
Total MATTHEWS, CANDICE: 91.04 .00
MBKEM ENTERPRISE
5350 MBKEM ENTERPRISE 234090-1 Invoi  rprd commerical overhead door, b 54-40-700 10/21/2016 448.53 .00
Total MBKEM ENTERPRISE: 448.53 .00
MERIDIAN TRUST FEDERAL CREDIT
5449 MERIDIAN TRUST FEDER 101916 Invoi PAYROLL WITHHOLDING 10-22780 10/19/2016 3,165.00 3,165,000 10/19/20186
Total MERIDIAN TRUST FEDERAL CREDIT: 3,165.00 3,165.00




CITY OF TORRINGTON

Payment Approval Report - Council
Report dates: 10/19/2016-10/28/2016

Page: 5

Oct 28, 2016 02:27PM

Vendor Vendor Name Invoice Number  Type Description GL Account# Invoice Date Invoice Amt Amount Paid  Date Paid
METTA TECHNOLOGIES, INC.
5450 METTA TECHNOLOGIES, 00038965 Invoi  5bull litter fence w/ canopy-trashs  54-45-880 10/14/2016 25,421.00 .00
Total METTA TECHNOLOGIES, INC.: 25,421.00 .00
MUNICIPAL CODE CORPORATION
5655 MUNICIPAL CODE CORP 00277511 Invoi  supplemnt to the code of ordinanc 10-44-300 10/24/2016 1,957.89 .00
Total MUNICIPAL CODE CORPORATION: 1,957.89 .00
OWENS, SAHARA
58 OWENS, SAHARA 15.02851.31 10 Invoi final billing - deposit return 53-22900 10/24/2016 71.71 .00
Total OWENS, SAHARA: 71.71 .00
PANHANDLE ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES INC
6005 PANHANDLE ENVIRONM 160900 Invoi  LAB ANALYSIS/E. coli-quanti-tray 52-40-830 08/15/2016 30.00 .00
6005 PANHANDLE ENVIRONM 161139 Invoi  lab analysis/e.coli-quanti-tray 52-40-830 10/14/2016 30.00 .00
6005 PANHANDLE ENVIRONM 161169 Invoi  lab analysis/e.coli-quanti-tray 52-40-830 10/21/2016 30.00 .00
Total PANHANDLE ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES INC: 90.00 .00
PATTLEN ENTERPRISES, INC
6070 PATTLEN ENTERPRISES, 1731463-00 Invoi  rod bearing-end 10-65-710 10/26/2016 31.98 .00
Total PATTLEN ENTERPRISES, INC: 31.98 .00
PINNACLE BANK
6124 PINNACLE BANK 8789 1016 Invoi  QTRIy lease purchase payment 58-40-870 10/14/2016 1,577.51 1,677.51 10/26/2016
6124 PINNACLE BANK 8789 1016 Invoi  QTRly lease purchase payment 58-40-200 10/14/2016 79.18 79.18 10/26/2016
6124 PINNACLE BANK 8789 1016 Invoi  QTRIy lease purchase payment 10-60-870 10/14/2016 5,101.34 5,101.34 10/26/2016
6124 PINNACLE BANK 8789 1016 Invoi  QTRly lease purchase payment 10-60-200 10/14/2016 256.05 256,05 10/26/2016
6124 PINNACLE BANK 8789 1016 Invoi  QTRIy lease purchase payment 10-54-870 10/14/2016 1,232.27 1,232,27 10/26/2016
6124 PINNACLE BANK 8789 1016 Invoi  QTRIy lease purchase payment 10-54-200 10/14/2016 61.85 61.85 10/26/2016
6124 PINNACLE BANK 8789 1016 Invoi  QTRIy iease purchase payment 10-65-875 10/14/2016 459.58 459.58 10/26/2016
6124 PINNACLE BANK 8789 1016 Invoi  QTRIy lease purchase payment 10-65-200 10/14/2016 23.07 23.07 10/26/2016
6124 PINNACLE BANK 8789 1016 Invoi  QTRIy lease purchase payment 51-75-870 10/14/2016 5723.46 5,723.46 10/26/2016
6124 PINNACLE BANK 8789 1016 Invoi  QTRIy lease purchase payment 51-75-200 10/14/2016 287.28 287.28 10/26/2016
Total PINNACLE BANK: 14,801.59 14,801.59
PITTMAN ELECTRIC, LLC
6144 PITTMAN ELECTRIC, LLC  049-4549 Invoi install heater elements @ baler bl 54-40-700 10/18/2016 930.00 .00
6144 PITTMAN ELECTRIC, LLC  049-4558 Invoi install 7 100A pedestls-rv park up 10-90-190 10/21/2016 5,450.00 00
Total PITTMAN ELECTRIC, LLC: 6,380 00 .00
QUILL CORPORATION
6400 QUILL CORPORATION 1303943 Invoi  pens36c¢t, ink cartrdge, post its, wi 10-14200 10/25/2016 75.94 00
Total QUILL CORPORATION; 75,94 .00
REGIONAL CARE INC
6567 REGIONAL CARE INC 1116FLEX AD  Invoi 11/16 select flex admin TOT01-00 10-22761 10/25/2016 76,50 76.50 10/26/2016
Total REGIONAL CARE INC 76.50 76.50




CITY OF TORRINGTON

Payment Approval Report - Council
Report dates: 10/19/2016-10/28/2016

Page: 6

Oct 28, 2016 02:27PM

Vendor Vendor Name Invoice Number Type Description GL Account # Invoice Date Invoice Amt Amount Paid  Date Paid
RICHARD D HOLSTEAD ENGINEERING
6600 RICHARD D HOLSTEAD E 5404 Invoi  substation desgn-sub miris & proc ~ 53-90-115 10/14/2016 1,542.75 .00
Total RICHARD D HOLSTEAD ENGINEERING: 1,642.75 .00
SAM'S WEST INC
6940 SAM'S WEST INC 8701054957 Invoi  toilet tissue dispenserx12 10-14200 10/24/2016 267.84 .00
Total SAM'S WEST INC: 267.84 .00
SMITTY'S REPAIR SERVICE
7240 SMITTY'S REPAIR SERVI 213201 Invoi  3/8"x3" flat iron per footx5 53-82-710 10/07/2016 20.25 .00
Total SMITTY'S REPAIR SERVICE 20.25 o]}
SOURCEGAS INC
7265 SOURCEGAS INC 207408052163  Invoi  Utilities - 2001 W C St 10-55-400 10/18/2016 46.13 46.13 10/26/2016
7265 SOURCEGAS INC 207408052163  Invoi  Utilities - 2 Pioneer Park St 10-55-400 10/18/2016 25.11 2511 10/26/2016
7265 SOURCEGAS INC 207408052229 Invoi  Utilities - 495B S Main St 10-68-400 10/20/2016 51.47 51.47 10/26/2016
7265 SOURCEGAS INC 207408052229 Invoi Utilities - 7076 Rd 55 F Waterplan 51-75-400 10/20/2016 108.54 108.54 10/26/2016
7265 SOURCEGAS INC 207408052229 Invoi  Utilities - 495A S Main St 10-68-400 10/20/2016 22.49 22,49 10/26/2016
7265 SOURCEGAS INC 207408052229 Invoi  Utilities - 495C Main St 10-68-400 10/20/2016 26.09 26.09 10/26/2016
7265 SOURCEGAS INC 207408052229 Invoi  Utilities - 1000 E 11th Ave/Trash 54-40-400 10/20/2016 114.62 114.62 10/26/2016
7265 SOURCEGAS INC 207408052229 Invoi  Ultilities - 2000 E 20th/Airport Offic 55-40-400 10/20/2016 23.08 23.08 10/26/2016
7265 SOURCEGAS INC 207408052229 Invoi  Utilities - 2602 E G St 10-65-400 10/20/2016 32.54 32.54 10/26/2016
7265 SOURCEGAS INC 207408052229 Invoi  Utilities - 350 W 21st Ave 10-68-400 10/20/2016 26.98 26.98 10/26/2016
7265 SOURCEGAS INC 207408052229 Invoi Utilities - 2502 E G St 57-40-400 10/20/2016 78.40 7840 10/26/2016
7265 SOURCEGAS INC 207408052229 Invoi  Utilities - 217 W 20th 10-48-400 10/20/2016 19.55 19.55 10/26/2016
7265 SOURCEGAS INC 207408052229 Invoi  Utilities - 301 E 30 59-40-400 10/20/2016 30.07 30.07 10/26/2016
7265 SOURCEGAS INC 207408052229 Invoi  Utilities - 306 E 30th Ave 59-40-400 10/20/2016 22.66 22,66 10/26/2016
7265 SOURCEGAS INC 207408052229 Invoi  Utilities - 651 Industrial Park Ave 51-75-400 10/20/2016 49 .82 49.82 10/26/2016
7265 SOURCEGAS INC 207408052229 Invoi  Utilities - 659 Industrial Park Ave 51-75-400 10/20/2016 3274 32.74 10/26/2016
7265 SOURCEGAS INC 207408052229 Invoi  Utilities - 436 E 22nd St 10-52-400 10/20/2016 146.03 146.03 10/26/2016
7265 SOURCEGAS INC 207408052229 Invoi  Utilities - 2241 EB 58-40-400 10/20/2016 17.72 17.72  10/26/2016
Total SOURCEGAS INC: 874.04 874.04
SOUTH TORRINGTON WATER & SEWER DISTRICT
7270 SOUTH TORRINGTON W 1076.01 1016 Invoi  water&sewer-Homesteaders' Mus 10-68-410 10/18/2016 64.00 64.00 10/26/2016
Total SOUTH TORRINGTON WATER & SEWER DISTRICT: 64.00 64.00
STANDARD INSURANCE COMPANY
7353 STANDARD INSURANCE 632979 00011 Invoi 11/2016 Premium-long term disab 10-22762 10/26/2016 1,799 44 1,799.44 10/26/2016
Total STANDARD INSURANCE COMPANY: 1,799.44 1,799.44
TORRINGTON EMPLOYEES INSURANCE
7880 TORRINGTON EMPLOYE 1116 PREMIU  Invoi  11/16 premium 10-22760 10/25/2016 75,548.11 75,548.11  10/26/2016
Total TORRINGTON EMPLOYEES INSURANCE: 75,548.11 75,548.11
TORRINGTON FIRE DEPT
7890 TORRINGTON FIRE DEP 102116 Invoi  professional services 11/2016 10-55-300 10/21/2016 800.00 00
Total TORRINGTON FIRE DEPT: 800.00 .00




CITY OF TORRINGTON

Payment Approval Report - Council
Report dates: 10/19/2016-10/28/2016

Page: 7

Oct 28, 2016 02:27PM

Vendor Vendor Name Invoice Number  Type Description GL Account# Invoice Date Invoice Amt Amount Paid  Date Paid
VOT INC
8465 VOT INC 615926 Invoi  halloween candy 10-41-960 10/27/2016 20.95 .00
8465 VOT INC 615935 Invoi  halloween candy 10-41-960 10/27/2016 2,05 .00
Total VOT INC: 23.00 00
WA M-WCCA
8495 WA M-WCCA 3535E Invoi  2nd installment-municipal/comm ¢ 10-52-870 10/17/2016 2,500.00 2,500.00 10/26/2016
Total W A M-WCCA: 2,500.00 2,500.00
W W GRAINGER INC
8540 W W GRAINGER INC 9243954428 Invoi  air cmprssr & wir pump prssure s 51-72-705 10/05/2016 86.40 .00
8540 W W GRAINGER INC 9263202971 Invoi  line voltage mechanical thermosta 51-75-700 10/26/2016 202.12 .00
Total W W GRAINGER INC: 288.52 .00
WASHINGTON NATIONAL INSURANCE CO
8575 WASHINGTON NATIONAL P1624958 Invoi PAYROLL WITHHOLDING-Group 10-22775 10/01/2016 32.70 32.70 10/19/2016
Total WASHINGTON NATIONAL INSURANCE CO: 32.70 32.70
WESTERN PATHOLOGY CONSULTANTS, INC
8700 WESTERN PATHOLOGY  0039861-IN Invoi  Random pool mgmt 10-58-530 10/21/2016 150.00 oo}
Total WESTERN PATHOLOGY CONSULTANTS, INC: 150.00 .00
WESTERN PLAINS BUSINESS
8710 WESTERN PLAINS BUSIN 112549-00 Invoi  Copier Maint-service agreement- 54-45-650 10/05/2016 38.23 .00
8710 WESTERN PLAINS BUSIN 112549-00 Invoi Copier Maint-service agreement-c ~ 51-75-650 10/05/2016 155,70 .00
Total WESTERN PLAINS BUSINESS: 193.93 .00
WESTERN RESEARCH AND DEVELOPME, LTD
8735 WESTERN RESEARCHA 5354 Invoi headwork design-sewer 52-90-300 09/30/2016 12,234.95 .00
Total WESTERN RESEARCH AND DEVELOPME, LTD: 12,234.95 .00
WUNDER, ROGER LEE
8864 WUNDER, ROGER LEE 29833 Invoi  tested microwave/do not fix 10-52-600 10/20/2016 68.50 .00
Total WUNDER, ROGER LEE: 68.50 .00
WYOMING CHILD SUPPORT
8951 WYOMING CHILD SUPPO 101916 Invoi PAYROLL WITHHOLDING 10-22705 10/19/2016 262.61 26261 10/19/2016
8951 WYOMING CHILD SUPPO 101916A Invoi PAYROLL WITHHOLDING 10-22705 10/19/2016 230.76 230,76  10/19/2016
Total WYOMING CHILD SUPPORT: 493.37 493,37
WYOMING CONTRACT TRANSPORTATION
8980 WYOMING CONTRACT T 725 Invoi  road spray-dust control @ pioneer 10-60-750 10/18/2016 2,105.00 .00
Total WYOMING CONTRACT TRANSPORTATION: 2,105.00 .00
WYOMING DEPT OF REVENUE
9020 WYOMING DEPT OF REV 7000203 0916  Invoi sales & use tax 09/2016 53-21400 09/30/2016 22,843.68 22,843.68 10/26/2016




CITY OF TORRINGTON

Payment Approval Report - Council
Report dates: 10/19/2016-10/28/2016

Page: 8
Oct 28, 2016 02:27PM

Vendor Vendor Name Invoice Number

Type Description GL Account # Invoice Date Invoice Amt

Amount Paid  Date Paid

Total WYOMING DEPT OF REVENUE:

22,843.68 22,843.68
WYOMING RETIREMENT SYSTEMS
9240 WYOMING RETIREMENT 132174 Invoi  10/16 Torr 2320 Vol EMT Pension 58-40-136 10/24/2016 60.00 60.00 10/26/2016
Total WYOMING RETIREMENT SYSTEMS: 60.00 60.00
Grand Totals: 311,933.75 144,713.41
Dated:
Mayor:
City Council:

City Recorder:

Report Criteria:
Detail report.
Invoices with totals above $0.00 included.
Paid and unpaid invoices included.




